
My dream was about being a 

super hero and taking bad 

guys down. In my other 

dreams I am: 

 

 king of the cheetahs 

 the best surfer in the 

whole wide world 

 a race car driver 

 a monster attacking Tokyo  

 a spider monkey swinging 

from vine to vine 

 

Hakim   – 2S 



In my dream I met Hannah 

Montana and I started to 

scream!  I asked her if I 

could have her autograph and 

she said, “Yes.” I was so 

happy. She told me I could 

hold her dog, too. It was cool. 

I met her little sister.  

 

Abigaelle   – 2S 



My dream was about getting 

an ice pop. Mmm, delicious! I 

got two ice pops. When recess 

was over, my class had to do 

math. Then we played a game. 

It was called Go Fish! I had a 

partner and her name was 

Natasha. She is a great 

partner. Then it was time to 

go home. I did my homework, 

read two books, and went to 

sleep. 

 

Jacklin  – 2S 



My dream was about the 

Incredible Hulk. The Hulk 

picked me up and he threw me 

into the lake. There were 

sharks in the lake. The Hulk 

sat on my head and I almost 

died, but Iron Man beat the 

Hulk up. The Hulk never came 

back. 

 

Jeremy  – 2S 



I had a dream about being the 

greatest basketball player in 

the world. I made a 3 pointer 

shot for my team. I passed 

the ball to my teammate, 

Wayne. He dribbled it and 

passed the ball to me and I 

made a slam dunk. Our team 

had 35 points and the other 

team had 30 points. My other 

teammate, Cameron, shot a 3 

pointer shot. 

 

Alvin  – 2S 



My dream was about when I saw 
Hannah Montana and we were having 
a great time. We were playing with so 
many games and having an ice cream 
party. Hannah and I called our friends 
so they could play and eat ice cream 
with us. When they came, we had a 
blast! We ate every single drop of ice 
cream. I had strawberry ice cream. It 
was really good! Hannah had 
chocolate ice cream. She said it was 
the best ice cream in the world! When 
our friends left, it was really late. 
Hannah and I went to my house and 
then we went to sleep. When we 
woke up, we ate breakfast together. 
Hannah had a bagel with butter. I had 
a bagel without anything on it. 

 

Nicole  – 2S 



 

My dream was about me. When I 

woke up, I felt different. Then I 

noticed I was a vampire. My skin 

was really white in the rain.  

Every day I wore dark colors. 

 I could climb to the top of 

trees. I could lift heavy things. 

I could run as fast as lightning.   

I really enjoyed being a vampire.  

But one morning, I was not a 

vampire. I was so sad. Then I 

was a vampire again! 

 

Natasha  – 2S 



In my dream I was a 

space man. I went to 

Jupiter and other 

planets.  

 

Jason  – 2S 



 

 

My dream was about being 

the queen of tarantulas. The 

tarantulas gave me rides to 

everywhere. I had eight 

horrible legs!  

“Now I must be fed,” I 

ordered them.  

“Yes, my queen.” 

 They gave me pineapple 

upside down cake. It was the 

best dream ever! 

 

Casandra  – 2S 



 

One morning, it was my 

birthday. A servant said to me, 

“HAPPY BIRTHDAY!” 

 I rushed downstairs.  My mom 

said, “Hi Jenny. Did you have a good 

sleep?” 

 I said, “Where are we going for 

my birthday?” 

 My mom said, “We are going to 

Jennyland.” 

“I have my own land?” 

“Yes, you do have a land.” 

“What time is my birthday 

party? 

“At 1:00 pm,” said my mom. 

It was a great birthday party. 

 

Jenny  – 2S 



 

I had a dream that I was on a 

cliff. Someone came and pushed 

me off the cliff and I fell in the 

water. I started to drown. A 

shark was thrashing. He tried to 

bite me with his sharp teeth.  

He almost ate me alive, but I 

was swimming so fast. I crashed 

into a rock. He almost caught 

me, but he hit a tall rock. I got 

to land and he came on land with 

me. I shot him with an arrow and 

he was dead. 

 

Wayne – 2S 



 

My dream was about a little girl 

who was eating her ice cream. A 

little boy wanted her ice cream. She 

said, “No!” He was a bully. He got 

mad and the girl was crying because 

the bully wanted to beat her up. 

The boy got in trouble and he was 

never seen again. 

 Do you like bullies? I do not like 

bullies. My mom said not to listen to 

bullies. Once, when it was snowing, a 

bully told me to climb on a branch. I 

told him I would not do it, but he 

said that if I didn’t do it he would 

beat me up. My mom came looking 

for me because we were leaving. 

She saw me stuck in the tree. 

 

Laila  – 2S 



I dreamed about falling into the ocean. 

I dreamed about Undertaker attacking 

me on stage. I dreamed about being a 

motocross player. I dreamed about 

having incredible powers. I dreamed 

about being like God. I dreamed about a 

little person stealing my dreams. I 

dreamed a thousand fans were running 

after me. I dreamed a monster truck 

was going to run over me. I dreamed 

about angry mobs running after me. I 

dreamed about angry monsters chasing 

me. I dreamed that all of my friends 

thought I was a nerd. I dreamed that I 

had bad luck. I kept falling off a cliff 

when I was hiking. I dreamed that all of 

my friends and I were zombies. I 

dreamed that I was like John Morrison 

and then I changed into Jeff Hardy. 

 

Teddy  – 2S 



My dream is about a star falling from 
the sky and landing in the woods.  
I snuck out of the house and went to 
the woods where the falling star 
landed. I saw the star. My eyes were 
glowing brighter and the star was 
blinking. I made a wish that the star 
was back in the sky. I went back 
home and fell asleep. In the morning, 
I told my mom what happened. I said 
I would go and see the star now.  
I went to the woods. The star was 
still there. It was not glowing. I got 
my friend Alex. She said it would 
glow at night. She said we should dig 
the dirt off the star so the star has 
space to fly back into the sky.  
 

Cindy M  – 2S 



I had a dream that I was a vampire 

eating people and animals.  

I had another dream about playing 

baseball with Jose Reyes and the 

Mets. We won every game that we 

played. Now we have to play the A’s 

for the championship. We won last 

year's championship. We played the 

Red Socks. I have to play them 

today. I play with the Mets. Today I 

have two games. I play baseball and 

basketball. Today I'm going to see 

the Mets game at City Field with my 

dad, my mom, and my cousin. When 

the game is over, my cousin is 

spending the night at my house. 

 
Cameron  – 2S 



 

In my dream, my family and I 

were running away from a giant 

boulder. My step dad tried to 

stop the boulder, but it was 

rolling too fast. I wondered 

how we would stop the boulder.  

Wait! Aaaahhhh! There it is! 

The boulder almost ran us 

over! Luckily, we hid in a cave 

on the rocky hill. Then we saw 

a dollar bill and we put it in a 

machine. The machine pushed 

us out of the cave. Oh no! 

There was another boulder! 

Chelsea – 2S 


